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TOWN OF HAMPDEN

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

106 WESTERN AVE.
HAMPDEN, ME 04444
TEL 862-3337 FAX 862-3910

June 14, 2012

To: Sue Lessard
From: Chip Swan
Subject: Annual Salt Purchase

On April 23rd Municipalities were given a chance to bid salt with Maine
DOT state wide.

June 1st" the results were announced as follows for Hampden:

BIDDER PRICE PER TON
HARCROS $57.21
CARGILL $63.42
EASTERN SALT NO BID

| recommend accepting HARCROS bid of $57.21 price per ton /salt
For the winter of 2012-2013.

Yours Truly,

Chip Swan, PWD
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EXHIBIT B . 20128Bid R e e T e
... Sodium - PRICES PER TON
- Chloride =~~~
Tons Harcros  Eastern . Cargill: .
City of Augusta 3000 $57.53 $67.32
City of Calais 500 $75.03 NO BID
City of Caribou 2000 $81.18 NO BID
City of Gardiner 1500 $58.20 $64.60
Town of Poland 900 $65.76 $66.58
Town of Abbott 120 $64.40 NO BID
Town of Atkinson 140 $64.06 NO BID
Town of Alna 250 $62.48 $69.92
Town of Amity 90 $78.39 NO BID
Town of Beals 70 $67.22 NO BID
Town of Bethel 500 $§71.70 $67.28
Town of Boothbay 500 $62.62 $65.62
Town of Belgrade 900 $60.00 $69.40
Town of Breman 190 $60.54 $68.11
Town of Brownville 320 $64.20 NO BID
Town of Caratunk 20 $§71.78 NO BID
Town of Chelsea 234 $61.78 $65.62
Town of China 300 $57.94 $65.90
Town of Columbia 210 $64.23 NO BID
Town of Cooper 210 $69.39 NO BID
Town of Crystal 33 $75.11 NO BID
Town of Cumberland 1620 $66.06 $70.20
Town of Dresden 650 $62.79 $70.35
Town of Dover-Foxcroft 750 $61.02 NO BID
Town of Dyer Brook 30 $74.64 NO BID
Town of Grand Isle 30 $90.38 NO BID
Town of Greenville 180 $66.33 NO BID
Town of Greenwood 400 $76.20 $66.12
l)_VL/D_O_f_C_S_uil_fmd 275 $63.16 NO BID
{ Town of Hampden 1200 $57.21 NO BID
Town of Hartland 275 $59.62 NO BID
Town of Hallowell 500 $60.78 $65.29
Town of Houlton 1600 $75.66 NO BID
Town of Island Falls 150 $73.12 NO BID
Town of Linneus 200 $74.82 NO BID
Town of Kingfield 150 $66.34 $75.74
Town of Machias 120 $66.70 NO BID
Town of Madawaska 700 $91.71 NO BID
Town of Maxfield 60 $66.70 NO BID
Town of Medford 150 $66.70 NO BID
Town of Mercer 158 $62.66 NO BID
Town of Milford 300 $58.98 NO BID

$65.54
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Dan MacDonald

Dennis Frigon - Rockwoo
Highland Plit.

Kingsbury Pit.

Mayfield

Town of Embden
Woodpecker Logging — C
Woodpecker Logging - Le
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