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TOWN OF HAMPDEN
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

106 WESTERN AVE.
HAMPDEN, ME 04444
TEL 862-3337 FAX 862-3910

July 23, 2015

To: Susan Lessard
From: Sean Currier
Subject: Trackless Sidewalk Machine

Last year, the Trackless sidewalk machine encountered a mechanical
breakdown which requires a very substantial rebuild or a replacement of
the existing machine.

| believe that a rebuild was budgeted in FY16 for the existing machine
with HP Fairfield. The existing machine is a 2003 with substantial rust
due to the harsh environment it encounters. When HP Fairfield rebuilds
the machine engine, there could still be additional costs associated, if
the hydraulic pump is not in proper working order, in the magnitude of
$6000-$8000 range. The cost of the rebuild is currently estimated and
budgeted at $55,000.00. With the rebuild, we still will have a 12 year old
machine. For an additional $41,784.00 we could purchase a new
machine that they currently have in stock. We currently have a need for
a machine that we can sweep paved surfaces with. Due to the amount of
sidewalks the town maintains and the importance of this machine, |
would like to recommend the purchase of a new Trackless MT6 with
local financing for the remaining balance above the $55,000.00 already
in the FY16 budget.

Thank you for your consideration.

Sincerely,

Sean Currier
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QUOTED TO: Town Of Hampden DATE: May 13, 2015
Canaan Road

Hampden VME 04402 CUSTOMER PHONE: 207-862-3337
ATTN:  Shawn CUSTOMER FAX: 207-862-3910

COMMENTS: Trackless machine refurbished and remanufactured engine

QTy DESCRIPTION PRICE EXT. PRICE

1 TRACKLESS MT5T SERIAL #:2266 REFURBISH TO INCLUDE; ALL NEW WINDSHIELD, $40,000.00 $40.000.00
HYDRAULIC HOSES, BRAKE LINES, CENTER PINS AND BUSHINGS, OSCILLATING
LINER, REAR PANELS, CABLES, RADIATOR, OiL COOLER, SEAT, INTERIOR PANEL,
STEERING PINS AND BUSHINGS, HEATER HOSES, U JOINTS AND DRIVE LINE PARTS
AS NEEDED, NEW SEALS IN 2 SPEED TRANSMISSION AND PTO GEARBOX, BRAKE
COMPONENTS AS NEEDED, SET CLUTGH TENSION, CHECK HYDRAULIC
PRESSURES, ALL FILTERS AND FLUIDS, CHECK HYDRASTATIC PRESSURE, CAB
BODY WORK, NEW REAR PANELS, SANDBLAST REAR FRAME AND PAINT ENTIRE
MACHINE

1 NEW REMANUFACTURED ENGINE INSTALLED $15.000.00 $15,000.00

NOT COVERED; HYDRASTATIC PUNP REPLACEMENT, CLUTCH REBLACEMENT,

THIS IS AN ESTIMATE BASED ON OUR EXPERIENGE FROM PREVIOUS JOBS we
HAVE DONE FOR OURSELVES AND CUSTOMERS

SIGNED{fassn. Cuns ACKNOWLEDGED QUOTE TOTAL $55,000.00

Serving New England for over 60 Years
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QUOTED TO: Town Of Hampden

DATE: July®, 2015

108160 106 Western Avenue _
Hampden » ME  04444-1428 CUSTOMER PHONE: 207-862-2357

ATTN:  Shawn CUSTOMER FAX: 207-862-5067

COMMENTS: Trackless MG (Stock Unit Serial # MT6-4917)

QTy DESCRIPTION PRICE EXT.PRICE

T ™ NEW TRACKLESS MT5 SIDEWALK TRACTOR. 4 WHEEL DRIVE NEW TIER 3 $98,784.00

ENGINE, HYDROSTATIC. DRIVE, FULLY ARTICULATING AND-OSCILLATING

MAIN FRAME DESIGN, 115 HP CUMMINS TURBO-CHARGED DIESEL ENGINE.

ROPS CERTIFIED SAFETY CAB, FULL INSTRUMENTATION. BEAR AXLES

WITH LIMITED SLIPCRADIAL TIRES HYDRAULIC SYSTEM TO ‘

OPERATE ALL TRACTOR FUNCTIONS WITH JOYSTICK CAB CONTROLS, F/R ON

JOYSTICK, BACKUP ALARM, AIC-HEATER- CAB PREBSUIZER WITH.8 STROBE PACK,

CLARION AM/FM RADIO, AIR RIDE HIGH BACK SEAT(EXTRA PUMP EGR DEDICATED:
¢ BROOM FLOW, REVERSING FANTPREPPED AND DELIVERED ™ o

$99,784.00

HAS THESE UPGRADES; . -
EXTRA FUMP FOR DEDICATED HYDRAULICS TO HROOM, FNR THUMB SHIFTER FOR

FORWARD AND REVERSE, SANDER MODE FOR GROUNDSPEED EFFECT, A/C
SYBTEM, RADIAL TIRES, REVERSING FAN FOR MOWER QPERATION

IN-5TOCK FOR IMMEDIATE DELIVERY

1 LESS TRADE OF 2003 MTST - 2268 WiTH ENGINE FAILGRE -$3,000.00 -$3,000.00
*** ONE YEAR WARRANTY PARTS AND LABQOR *
SIGNEDfon Thalhll ACKNOWLEDGED QUOTE TOTAL $96,784.00

Serving New England for over 60 Years




TOWN OF HAMPDEN
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

106 WESTERN AVE.
HAMPDEN, ME 04444
TEL 862-3337 FAX B62-3910

July 24, 2015

To: Susan Lessard
From: Sean Currier
Subject: Beneficial Use Permit for Public Works Department

With storm water regulations and maintenance activities on the rise, the Public
Works Department is trying to become proactive to cut costs associated with
treatment, operation and maintenance of our infrastructure.

| have recently solicited budget estimates from three (3) contractors ta provide
maintenance of our catch basins to meet applicable regulatory requirements in
our MS4 permit. The Public Works Department would like to apply for a
Beneficial Use Permit, in order to dispose of the material removed from catch
basins, at the Municipal Garage, prior to a contractor being solicited. This
would eliminate the need to pay for trucking and disposal costs to Juniper
Ridge Landfill. The material is essentially sand and gravel washed in to the
catch basins by rain and run-off. This material can be monitored and reused for
items such as road shoulders, construction trench backfill, sanding and more.
The cost to hire a contractor with a specialized vacuum truck to remove grit
from basins is approximately $200/hr. The Town would be paying almost $400
per trip (or for every 10 yds) for trucking and approximately $75/ton of material
disposed of at Juniper Ridge Landfill. | would like to request the funds be
allocated from the Solid Waste/Municipal Garage reserve account in the
amount of $3500.00 to secure this permit. The permit could pay for itself with
reduced disposal and trucking costs within two years of services.

Thank you for your consideration.

Sincerely,

Sean Currier
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TOWN OF HAMPDEN
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

106 WESTERN AVE.
HAMPDEN, ME 04444
TEL 862-3337 FAX 862-3910

July 24, 2015

To: Susan Lessard
From: Sean Currier
Subject: Garage Modifications 3-778-00

The Municipal Garage is in need of some spill containment and flammables
storage upgrades in order to be compliant with current regulations. | would like
to request the allocation of funds in the amount (not to exceed) $5000.00 from
the Garage Modification reserve account to get the garage in to compliance.
Some items include (but are not limited to):

- 2-3 flammables storage cabinets for gas cans, spray paint, lubricants ete.
- spill containment for (2) 40 gallon oil drums
- spill containment for 135 gallon diesel generator fuel tank

-spill containment for 5 gallon buckets of various oils, hydraulic fluids etc.
- new 55 gallon drum funnel for used motor oil

Thank you for your consideration.

Sincerely,

Sean Curier




